
From: Greg Shepard greg@rapower3.com 
Subject: FW: Ra3: Mike Robins 

Date: March 28, 2016 at 12:32 PM 
To: Mike-George Robins ruthrobins@gmail.com 
Cc: Roger Hamblin rogham@infowest.com 

Mike, Sorry, but Neldon and Glenda make the decisions. Greg 

Greg, 

Neldon said that he ordered the lenses we had to buy the lenses to show that they were there. 
All these should have been paid in full by 2013. He owes $35,201.00. 

He ordered the 42lenses in 2010- he would of had his refund back and he never paid for 
them. Same for 2011 & 2012. The contract says the following year they are to be paid in 
full. He never paid for them, he just sent in little payments. 

Neldon said that the Company could go after the estate to insist that the contracts be paid in 
full. When people sign up they know that these need to be paid the following year, 
otherwise they should not be buying them. When he was well and healthy he chose not to 
pay for them. Now it is a different situation. 

Neldon said that the Company will not go after the estate for payment, but that there will be 
no money paid out on the lenses, or referral fee contracts. 

There will be no refund on any of the money paid in. He did not pay them off as .he should 
have. 

This is no different than if you buy a car and choose not to pay your payments, then the car 
gets repossessed and you lose the car and any money you paid on it. 

Glenda 

From: greg@rapower3.com 
To: ruthrobins@ gmail.com 
CC: glendaejohnson@hotmail.com; rogham@infowest.com 
Subject: Ra3: Mike Robins 
Date: Fri, 25 Mar 2016 09:43:10-0600 

EXHIBIT 4~ g' 
WIT: G. Shepard­
DATE: 5: ~ 2 2 - 1 l 

Glenda, 
CitiCourt, LLC 

Mike-George Robins has terminal cancer and is not doing well. RaPower3 seems to be the 
only real thing he can leave to his kids. 
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Here's the problem: He ordered 42 1ense,.;; in 2010 and owes $15,700. He ordered another 
15 in 2011 and 15 again in 2012. 

Roger Hamblin is going to help Mike with analyzing his ta'\es. I (We) need to know if he 
used the 15 lens order for tax benefits. If so, we cannot undo that. If he did not, perhaps 
we can take back the lenses and credit \vhat he has paid and apply that to the 421enses. Thi s 
would get him closer to getting those lenses paid. 

IJ he did use all of hi lenses on his taxe , perhaps we can apply the exl.ra amounts paid on 
the two 15-lens orders to the 42-lens order. That would bri11g down the amount owed to 
$6,851. 

We obviously need to get his tax. info analyzed before any decision can be made. I'm just 
giving you a heads up. 

Thanks, Greg 

Greg Shepard 
RaPowcr3 
Chief Director of Operations 
4035 South 4000 West 
Deseret, UT 84624 
801-699-2284 
ww\v.rapower3 .com 

NOTICE: This copy1ighted emai l and any files transmitted with it are confidential and 
intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed and may 
be subject to legal p1ivilege. If you have received this email in error, please notify the 
system manager. You should not di sseminate, distribute or copy this email. If you are not tbe 
intended recipient, you are notified that di sclosing, copying, distlibuting or taking any action 
in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. 
Please Also. Note: Greg Shepard is an Independent Contractor and is not and has never been 
an employee, officer or board member of International Automated Systems, RaPowei-3 or 
any other business or entitiy created by Neldon Johnson or bis associates. 
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