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LeRoy CUSD No. 2 Mail - RE: BFS Stimulus Plan 4/16/16, 6:04 PM

EXHIBIT NO. \{L

FOR IDENTIFICATION
oate: 853/, RetR: Lp

RE: BFS Stimulus Plan

Roger Freeborn <coachfreeb@bfsmail.com> Sat, Oct 10, 2009 at 10:57 AM
To: "Zeleznik, Brian" <bj_zeleznik@leroy.k12.il.us>

| have great news. It's a go!

| have attached the correct forms along with an instructional page for filling those out. Let's set a time on Monday for
filling out the forms properly and sending them in.

Be11!

RF

From: Zeleznik, Brian [mailto:bj_zeleznik@leroy.k12.il.us]
Sent: Friday, October 09, 2009 7:52 AM

To: coachfreeb@bfsmail.com

Subject: BFS Stimulus Plan

Coach Freeborn,

I had the pleasure of visiting with you at the end of the summer in regards to the BFS stimulus plan. I am not sure
how many units are still available, if any. I had mentioned that my wife and I would be interested in investing in a
unit and putting the $30,000 into a savings fund for my 4 year old son with special needs. We would love to be able
to do that at this time if still possible. Please let me know if this offer still exists and what steps I need to take to get
the ball rolling. Thank you very much for taking the time to visit our community and providing this opportunity.

BJ Zeleznik

Athletic Director/Head Football
Le Roy High School

Le Roy, IL

309-962-2911 x. 224 (office)

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=b096062699&view=pt&q=...1=1243f2b9902cfS5f6&siml=12441f153b399cda&siml=124542919c6bd873 Page 1 of 3
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309-825-7898 (celt)

3 attachments

T:l IAS-EquipPurchRev[8].pdf
— 43K

@_] IAUS 2009 Referral Contract.doc
— 25K

iy IAUS Instructions.doc
4] 29K

Roger Freeborn <coachfreeb@bfsmail.com=>
To: "Zeleznik, Brian" <bj_zeleznik@leroy.k12.il.us>

Sat, Oct 10, 2009 at 11:53 PM
Great.
Get the forms printed out and in front of you on Monday. When you are ready, give me a call and we will do it.

Talk to you then.

RF

From: Zeleznik, Brian [mailto:bj_zeleznik@leroy.k12.il.us]

Sent: Saturday, October 10, 2009 9:40 PM

To: Roger Freeborn E - -
Subject: RE: BFS Stimulus Plan

Coach,

That's wonderfull!!  Thank you for your help and please thank Dr. Shepard on behalf of my family. Would you be
available sometime between 12:30 and 1:30 pm on Monday? I can give you a call. Let me know.

Thanks again!

BJ Zeleznik

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=b096062699&view=pt&q=...|=1243f2b3902cf5f6&sim|=12441f153b399cda’simi=124542919c6bd873 Page 2 of 3
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From: Roger Freeborn [coachfreeb@bfsmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, October 10, 2009 10:57 AM

To: Zeleznik, Brian

Subject: RE: BFS Stimulus Plan

[Quoted text hidden]

Roger Freeborn <coachfreeb@bfsmail.com>
To: "Zeleznik, Brian" <bj_zeleznik@leroy.k12.il.us>
Cc: greg@bfsmail.com

Wed, Oct 14, 2009 at 12:47 PM
Great! We will keep in touch on developments.

Be11!

RF

From: Zeleznik, Brian [mailto:bj_zeleznik@leroy.k12.il.us]
Sent: Wednesday, October 14, 2009 8:37 AM

To: Roger Freeborn

Subject: RE: BFS Stimulus Plan

Hi Coach,
The paperwork has been mailed and it should arrive Friday at the latest....| sent it priority express. Thanks again for
your help!

Coach Zeleznik

From: Roger Freeborn <coachfreeb@bfsmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, October 10, 2009 11:53 PM
To: Zeleznik, Brian <bj_zeleznik@ieroy.k12.il.us>

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]
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Make your check out to International Automated Systems.
OK. Go to page one of the EQUIPMENT PURCHASE AGREEMENT

Put in the day-month and year. Now your name and address:
WRITE VERY CLEARLY, PLEASE

Now go to #1 and put in "ONE" if you are purchasing one.
Then put in "DELTA, UTAH"

Next go to #2a and putin "DECEMBER 31,2009"

OK. Go to page two to #4 and put in "LTB,LLC" then "LAS
VEGAS, NEVADA"

Then sign and date under PURCHASER on page 6
On page 7 put "ONE" under quantity

Don't worry about the Model or Serial numbers. They will given
to you later after your units are built.

NOW GO TO THE SOLAR PURCHASE REFERRAL FEE CONTRACT
Again clearly write in your name and full address.

Next Blank spot put in the date.

Next write "THREE" then "3"

Now the total number of units purchased is "ONE" then (1)

total Referral Fee is "POINT ZERO ZERO THREE PERCENT" AND
THEN (0.003%)

Finally, sign and date it.

ZELEZ B&A000725
PLEX00054.0004
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2009
Solar Purchase Referral Fee Contract

This Referral Fee Contract by and between NELDON JOHNSON of 326 N. Salem, Utah
84653 and

Hereinafter referred to as “Purchaser”, with an address of

In consideration for (a) the purchase by Purchaser of International Automated Systems’
(IAS”) Solar Lenses as evidenced by execution of the Equipment Purchase Agreement
dated (hereinafter referred to as “Equipment Purchase
Agreement”); (b) the payment by Purchaser to IAS of the Purchase payment at the time
of signing the Equipment Purchase Agreement; and (c) Purchaser agreeing to make the
lenses available to IAS as a reference for marketing and sales purposes to show and
demonstrate to potential customers (“New Customers”), Purchaser or designated assigns
by the Purchaser has earned and shall thereafter receive a referral fee (the “Referral Fee,”
as more fully explained below) for services performed by allowing access and use for
sales purposes, for each Solar Lens purchased, the Referral Fee shall be a zero point zero
and zero percent (0.00 % on referral amounts up to One Billion Dollars
($1,000,000,000) received by IAS from all sales based on the gross revenues of the
company. ’ ‘

As evidenced by the execution of the Equipment Purchase Agreement, the total number

of Solar Lenses purchased by Purchaser is ( )
The total Referral Fee is ( %)
PURCHASER DATE NELDON JOHNSON DATE

1. DESIGNATED ASSIGNS:
Address:

Total Amount of Referral Fee Assigned: ( %)

2. DESIGNATED ASSIGNS:
Address:

Total Amount of Referral Fee Assigned: ( %)
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